
BIDDER'S NAME & CONTACT INFORMATION
BID 

BOND
AFFID

ADDEN 
REC'D

BID ALT. 1 ALT. 2

Aiken Grading (Sean Whitaker)                                                           
9139 Aiken Drive, Dallas, GA  30157         
swhitaker@aikengrading.com (770)445-3224) x18

x x $2,904,365.00 -$154,353.00 -$90,000.00

Astra Group, Inc. (Christian Long)                                                            
300 Churchill Court, Woodstock, GA 30188          
clong@astagroupinc.com (770)992-9300)

x x $2,930,000.00 -$15,000.00 -$60,000.00

Baldwin Paving Company, (Mickey Chadwick)                                    
1014 Kenmill Drive, Marietta, GA 30060                                
mchadwick@baldwin-paving.com (770)425-9191

x x $2,670,405.00 -$170,000.00 -$83,000.00

Blount Construction Co., Inc.  (No Contact Information)                                    
1730 Sands Place, Marietta, GA 30067                                                    
No Contact Information

NO BID

Brad Cole Construction Co., Inc.  (Brooks Lewis)                                    
2250 Lovvorn Rd. Carrollton, GA 30117          
brooksl@bradcoleconstruction.com (770)834-4681)

NO BID

Capital Grading & Paving  (Brad Hawkins)                                                                  
89 Chambers Industrial Drive, Jasper, GA 30143         
bhawkins@capgp.com (706)253-6011)

NO BID

Carl Owen Construction (Brent Laminak)                                         
2904 S. Highway 27, Carrollton, GA 30117          
brent@carlowenconstruction.com (770)832-2275)

NO BID

Carrollton Grading (Jeff Driver)                                                                                         
35 Maple Lane, Carrollton, GA 30117                                                   
jvdriver@bellsouth.net (770)214-8100)

NO BID
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Charles Sullivan Construction Company, Inc.                                     
1079 Historic Homer Hwy.(P.O. Box 67) Homer, GA 30547          
construction.sullivan@gmail.com (706)677-2228)

NO BID

Ed Smith Construction Co., Inc.  (James Langford)                                    
1480 Terrell Mill Rd. Suite F, Marietta, GA 30067          
edsmithconst@aol.com (770)952-9187)

NO BID

Ellis Astin Grading (David Hosey)                                                                                 
9139 Villa Rica Hwy.  Villa Rica, GA  30180                        
dhosey@ellisastingrading.com (770)459-9000)

NO BID

Jackson Paving Company,  (John Hufstetler)                                    
6481 West Bankhead Hwy. Douglasville, GA 30134         
jacksonpaving@comcast.net (770)942-6426)

x x $2,800,000.00 -$200,000.00 -$85,000.00

JHC Corporation  (Marie Holbrook)                                                                                     
150 North Industrial Drive, Palmetto, GA 30268                                                 
(770)487-3258)

NO BID

Lewallen Construction Co., (Adam Chance)                                                                 
151 Bells Ferry Lane, Marietta, GA 30066                                                              
(770)426-6667)

NO BID

Nature Bridges  (Richard Ridley)                                                           
2074 Raymond Pier Rd. Tallahassee, FL 32308          
richard@naturebridges.com (850)385-3234

NO BID

Plateau Excavation  (Phillip Young)                                                          
375 Lee Industrial Boulevard, Austell, GA 30168          
pyoung@plateauexcavation.com (770)834-4681)

x x $2,887,306.00 -$206,950.00 -$41,150.00

Reeves Contracting Co., (J. Bledsoe)                                                  
1400 Buford Hwy. Sugar Hill, GA 30518           
jbledsoe@reevescontracting.com (770)271-1159)

NO BID

Reid Construction (Eric Sims)                                                                 
146 Edge Road,  Villa Rica, GA 30180                                                   
erics@reidconstruct.com (770)456-6254)

NO BID
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Rogers Bridge Company  (Casey Cagle)                                               
1800 Briarcliff Road, Atlanta, GA 30329         
casey.cagle@shepconst.com (404)633-5522)

NO BID

Ronny D. Jones  (Joseph)                                                                           
679 Hwy. 29 South, Suite A,Newnan, GA 30263          
joseph@ronnydjones.com (678)633-5522

NO BID

Sanford Land Development Co., Inc. (Tim Crawford)                                         
P. O. Box 406, Rockmart, GA 30153                                                             
tcrawford@sanfordld.com (678)757-0032)

NO BID

Southeastern Site Development Inc. (Eric Ogren)                                                    
14 E. Gordon Rd.  Newnan, GA  30263                                
eogren@sesiteco.com (678)423-7770

x x $3,294,565.01 -$223,400.00 -$36,120.00

Thompson Grading & Clearing, Inc.                                                       
210 East College Street, Bowdon, GA 30108          
brian@thompsongrading.com (770)258-4749

NO BID

Thompson Grading, Inc.  (Kevin Bentley)                                                      
1086 Industrial Boulevard North, Dallas, GA 30132          
kevin@thompsongrading.net (770)445-2995

x

Only up 
to 

Adden. 
2

$2,761,977.58 -$269,310.00 -$87,000.00

W.F. Jackson Construction Company, Inc.  (Chris Pope)                                    
P.O. Box 391, Sandersville, GA 30182                              
clpope8@hotmail.com (478)552-1201)

NO BID


	Sheet1

