
Vendor 1/2 Ton Pick-Up 
Truck

1 1/2 Ton Chassis 
Cab Truck 

W/Body

3/4 Ton Pick-Up 
Truck

Police 
Interceptor

1 1/2 Ton Chassis 
Cab Truck

Richard Haney 
Ford $26,713.55 $44,226.55 No Bid $23,300.64 $32,344.03

Don-Rich Ford $26,774.55 $39,328.03 $31,553.34 $22,989.64 $30,808.03

Walker GMC $25,581.93 No Bid $33,555.76 No Bid No Bid

Pioneer Ford $27,190.53 $37,062.33 $32,305.34 $22,990.00 No Bid

John Thornton 
Chevrolet $25,750.38 No Bid $33,356.18 $26,702.00 No Bid
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