SUMMARY SHEET FOR VEHICLES (SOLICITATION 09-A027)

Vendor Tax Assessor's Office Maintenance Correctional Institution Agriculture Center
1Ton
Compact Compact 1/2 Ton Cargo 1/2 Ton 15-Passenger
Model Pick-Up |OR Model SUV Model Van Model Pick-Up 4x4 Model Van
Don-Rich Ford |Ford Ranger $12,517.75|OR|Ford Escape | $16,072.85|Ford E150 $17,763.70{Ford F150 XL | $24,174.75[Ford E350 Van $22,349.70
Walker GMC |GMC Canyon | $13,385.95|OR|Pontiac Vibe [ $16,894.00|GMC Savana| $18,508.35|GMC Sierra $23,989.43|GMC Savana $25,263.33
Option 1 * 2008 Used $19,200.00
Family Ford Ford Ranger $12,175.00{OR|Ford Escape | $15,948.00|Ford E150 $17,206.00({Ford F150 XL | $23,732.00{Ford E350 Van $23,732.00
Option 1 ** Ford E250 $15,838.00
Mike Bell Chevy
Chevrolet No Bid No Bid [OR|Chevy HHR | $16,430.00|Express $17,612.00(Silverado 1500 | $23,344.00{Chevy Express $23,725.00
John Thornton Chevy
Chevrolet Chevy Colorado| $16,445.00|OR|Chevy HHR | $15,621.00|Express $21,687.00(Siverado 1500 | $28,134.00{Chevy Express $29,773.00
Pioneer Ford |Ford Ranger $14,037.60[{OR No Bid No Bid [Ford E150 $20,438.70{Ford F150 XL | $27,151.74{Ford E350 Van $25,678.70
Richard Haney
Ford Ford Ranger $11,658.00{OR No Bid No Bid [Ford E150 $17,704.70{Ford F150 XL | $24,115.75{Ford E350 Van $22,290.70
Scott Evans Jeep
Dodge No Bid No Bid [OR|Compass $17,695.00 No Bid No Bid Dodge $31,091.00 No Bid No Bid

* Option of a Used 2008 15-Passenger Van
** Can Provide a E-250 off State Contract as an option.




COMPARISON DATA

Compact Pick-Up Truck Option- Tax Assessor

Richard Haney| Family Ford |Don-Rich Ford| Pioneer
Ford Ranger $11,658.00f $12,175.00 $12,517.75| $14,037.60
Walker GMC
GMC Canyon $13,385.95
Thornton Chev
Chevy Colorado $16,445.00
Compact SUV Option- Tax Assessor
Thornton Chev Mike Bell
Chevy HHR $15,621.00 $16,430.00
Family Ford |Don-Rich Ford
Ford Escape $15,948.00 $16,072.85
Walker GMC
Pontiac Vibe $16,894.00

Scott Evans

Jeep Compass

$17,695.00

Warranty MPG Delivery
3 /36000 B-B
5 /50000 PT 21/26
3 /36000 B-B
5/100000 PT 18/ 24
3 /36000 B-B
5/100000 PT 18/ 24
Warranty MPG Delivery
3 /36000 B-B
5 /50000 PT 22 /30
3 /36000 B-B
5 /50000 PT 20/ 28
3 /36000 B-B
5 /50000 PT 25/31
3 /36000 B-B
LIFETIME PT 23127




1/2 Ton Cargo Van- Maintenance Dept

Warranty

MPG

Delivery

3/36000 B-B
5 /50000 PT

3/36000 B-B
5 /50000 PT

3/36000 B-B
5/100000 PT

Family Ford | Richard Haney |Don-Rich Ford
Ford E-150 $17,206.00f $17,704.70 $17,763.70
Mike Bell
Chevy Express $17,612.00
Walker GMC
GMC Savana $18,508.35
Family Ford
* Ford Express
E-250 $15,838.00

3/36000 B-B
5 /50000 PT

* Dealer can provided a E-250 off State Contract.

1/2 Ton 4 x 4 Super Crew Pick-Up- Correctional Institute

Warranty

MPG

Delivery

3/36000 B-B
5/100000 PT

14/19

3 /36000 B-B
5/50000 PT

14/19

Mike Bell Thornton
Silverado 1500 $23,344.00f $28,134.00
Family Ford | Richard Haney |Don-Rich Ford| Pioneer
Ford F150XL $23,732.00f $24,115.75 $24,174.75| $27,151.74
Walker GMC
GMC Sierra $23,989.43

3/36000 B-B
5/100000 PT

14/18

Scott Evans

Dodge

$31,091.00

3/36000 B-B
LIFETIME PT

13/18




1 Ton 15-Passenger Van

Warranty

MPG

Delivery

3/36000 B-B
5 /50000 PT

3/36000 B-B
5/100000 PT

Richard Haney | Don-Rich Ford | Family Ford Pioneer
Ford E-350 $22,290.70 $22,349.70 $23,732.00{ $25,678.70
Mike Bell Thornton
Chevy Express $23,725.00f $29,773.00
Walker GMC
GMC Savana $25,263.33
Walker GMC
* 2008 Used
GMC Savana $19,200.00

* Dealer has a used 2008 on the lot.
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