SUMMARY SHEET SOLICITATION (09-A024)
PRE-OWNED CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT FOR CARROLL COUNTY PUBLIC WORKS DEPT

Yancey Brothers Company
PRE-OWNED NEW- STATE CONTRACT
Model Description Qty Cost Buy-back | Hours| Year Model Cost Buy-Back | Remarks
930H Wheel Loader 1 $123,000.00{ $70,000.00 857| 2008 930H $151,000.00
621G Wheel Tractor Scraper| 1 $380,000.00| $160,000.00{ 1298| 2006 621G $620,000.00
621G Wheel Tractor Scraper| 1 $380,000.00| $160,000.00{ 1347| 2006 621G $620,000.00
963D Track Loader 1 $209,500.00{ $80,000.00 443] 2008 963D $246,000.00
AP1000D Asphalt Paver 1 $247,000.00{ $70,000.00 762| 2006 AP1000 $332,000.00
140M Motorgrader 1 $204,900.00{ $110,000.00 178| 2008 140M $224,500.00
140M Motorgrader 1 $204,900.00{ $110,000.00 198( 2008 140M $224,500.00
140H Motorgrader 1 $174,700.00{ $88,000.00 718| 2005 140M $224,500.00
140H Motorgrader 1 $174,700.00] $88,000.00 1415( 2005 140M $224,500.00
D8T Track Type Tractor w/
w/Ripper | Single Shank Ripper | 1 $399,000.00| $190,000.00 932| 2007 D8T $560,000.00
D6N LGP | Track Type Tractor 1 $162,000.00{ $72,000.00 934| 2007 D6NXL $229,000.00
CS533 Compactor, Padfoot | 1 $86,100.00{ $30,000.00 600| 2007 CS533 $119,904.00
RT450 Trencher, Ride-On 1 $19,000.00{None Offered $19,000.00
Total $2,764,800.00 $3,794,904.00
Tractor and Equipment Company
PRE-OWNED NEW
Model Description Qty Cost Buy-Back | Hours| Year Model Cost Buy-Back | Remarks
930H Wheel Loader 1 No Bid None Offered Komatsu WA250PT-5 $98,725.00{ $79,000.00 1
621G Wheel Tractor Scraper| 1 $387,640.00|None Offered| 1598| 2006
621G Wheel Tractor Scraper| 1 $237,500.00|None Offered| 3288| 2004
963D Track Loader 1 $272,300.00{None Offered 500| 2008
AP1000D Asphalt Paver 1 No Bid None Offered Blaw Knox/Volvo Paver | $242,000.00| $120,000.00
140M Motorgrader 1 No Bid None Offered
140M Motorgrader 1 No Bid None Offered
140H Motorgrader 1 No Bid None Offered 2009 KomatsuGD655-3 | $177,000.00]| $120,000.00 2
140H Motorgrader 1 $179,800.00|{None Offered| 2650| 2004
D8T Track Type Tractor w/
w/Ripper | Single Shank Ripper | 1 $427,800.00[None Offered| 2000| 2006 |2009 Komatsu D155AX-6[ $399,890.00| $250,000.00
D6N LGP | Track Type Tractor 1 $135,000.00{None Offered] 2300| 2006 | 2009 KomatsuD61EX-15( $137,900.00 3
CS533 Compactor, Padfoot 1 No Bid None Offered 2007 Ingersoll-Rand $86,900.00{ $55,000.00
Total $1,640,040.00 $1,142,415.00

Remarks 1 - Alternative Model 2009 Komatsu WA250PZ-6 available for $ 114,100.00 w/buy-back $ 79000.00. Optional Forks Available
Remarks 2 - Alternative Model 2009 Komatsu GD555-3 available for $ 159,900.00 w/buy-back $ 100,000.00
Remarks 3 - Alternative Model 2009 Komatsu D61EX-15EOQ available for $ 165,300.00 w/buy-back $ 105,000.00
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